

**BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT**

1 of 1

ICE CONTROL SAND

**RECORD OF BIDS**

**DATE:** 26-Apr-18

<b>BIDDER:</b>	<i>Michiana Aggr.</i>		<i>Kalin</i>		<i>Hollerbach</i>					
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>		<b>PRICE PER TON</b>		<b>PRICE PER TON</b>		<b>PRICE PER TON</b>		<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	
<b>ESTIMATED QUANTITIES</b>	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY
Benton Harbor      4000 Tons	<b>6.48</b>	<b>7.82</b>	<b>6.28</b>	No bid	<b>6.28</b>	No bid				
Bakertown            4000 Tons	<b>5.91</b>	<b>6.16</b>	<b>5.76</b>	No Bid	<b>7.05</b>	No Bid				
Eau Claire            3000 Tons	<b>5.60</b>	<b>7.56</b>	<b>5.13</b>	No Bid	<b>6.43</b>	No Bid				
Watervliet            500 Tons	<b>6.30</b>	<b>8.00</b>	<b>6.28</b>	No Bid	<b>7.99</b>	No Bid				
Baroda                4000 Tons	<b>5.25</b>	<b>7.70</b>	<b>6.28</b>	No Bid	<b>5.80</b>	No Bid				
Three Oaks            500 Tons	<b>6.65</b>	<b>6.90</b>	<b>6.88</b>	No Bid	<b>8.30</b>	No Bid				
STOCKPILE LOCATION	<b>Hendershoot Pit</b>				<b>Twin Springs Aggregate</b>					
PRICE PER TON	<b>No Bid</b>				<b>\$3.10</b>					
STOCKPILE LOCATION	<b>MAI US-12</b>									
PRICE PER TON	<b>\$5.00</b>									
STOCKPILE LOCATION										
PRICE PER TON										





















