

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

CONCRETE PIPE PRODUCTS

RECORD OF BIDS

13-Apr-17

CONTRACTOR	Northern Conc.					
CONCRETE PIPE PRODUCTS						
12" CLASS I	No Bid					
12" CLASS II	No Bid					
12" CLASS III	No Bid					
12" CLASS IV	8.66					
12" CLASS V	10.03					
15" CLASS I	No Bid					
15" CLASS II	No Bid					
15" CLASS III	10.55					
15" CLASS IV	10.87					
15" CLASS V	12.65					
18" CLASS I	No Bid					
18" CLASS II	No Bid					
18" CLASS III	12.97					
18" CLASS IV	13.38					
18" CLASS V	15.54					
24" CLASS I	No Bid					
24" CLASS II	No Bid					
24" CLASS III	18.80					
24" CLASS IV	21.05					
24" CLASS V	24.41					
30" CLASS I	No Bid					

CONTRACTOR		Northern Conc.					
CONCRETE PIPE PRODUCTS							
30"	CLASS II	30.03					
30"	CLASS III	31.13					
30"	CLASS IV	32.70					
30"	CLASS V	37.90					
36"	CLASS I	No Bid					
36"	CLASS II	42.00					
36"	CLASS III	42.89					
36"	CLASS IV	43.89					
36"	CLASS V	50.87					
<u>TERMS/REMARKS:</u>							