

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT

AGGREGATES

02/01/2018

1 OF 2

CONTRACTOR		Kenneth Smith		Reith Riley		Verplank	
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount

WATERVLIET

3,000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 16.49	\$ 49,470.00	\$ 17.95	\$ 53,850.00	No Bid	
1,000	Ind. No 9BF Slag	\$ 16.45	\$ 16,450.00	\$ 18.25	\$ 18,250.00	No Bid	

BENTON HARBOR

5,000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.64	\$ 78,200.00	\$ 16.45	\$ 82,250.00	No Bid	
500	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.64	\$ 7,820.00	\$ 16.75	\$ 8,375.00	No Bid	
400	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 15.14	\$ 6,056.00	\$ 15.20	\$ 6,080.00	No Bid	
100	Septic Slag	\$ 15.95	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 16.20	\$ 1,620.00	No Bid	

EAU CLAIRE

4,000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.64	\$ 62,560.00	\$ 16.95	\$ 67,800.00	No Bid	
1,400	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.99	\$ 22,386.00	\$ 17.25	\$ 24,150.00	No Bid	
400	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 15.19	\$ 6,076.00	\$ 15.70	\$ 6,280.00	No Bid	
100	Septic Slag	\$ 15.95	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 16.70	\$ 1,670.00	No Bid	

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT

AGGREGATES

02/01/2018

2 OF 2

CONTRACTOR		Kenneth Smith		Reith Riley		Verplank	
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount

THREE OAKS

2,000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.49	\$ 28,980.00	16.45	\$ 32,900.00	No Bid	
500	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.79	\$ 7,395.00	16.75	\$ 8,375.00	No Bid	
500	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 14.19	\$ 7,095.00	15.20	\$ 7,600.00	No Bid	
100	Septic Slag	\$ 14.94	\$ 1,494.00	16.20	\$ 1,620.00	No Bid	
835	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	\$ 46.95	\$ 39,203.25	No Bid		\$ 38.16	\$ 31,863.60

BAKERTOWN

5,000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.89	\$ 74,450.00	16.70	\$ 83,500.00	No Bid	
1,000	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.89	\$ 14,890.00	17.00	\$ 17,000.00	No Bid	
500	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 14.19	\$ 7,095.00	15.45	\$ 7,725.00	No Bid	
200	Septic Slag	\$ 14.94	\$ 2,988.00	16.45	\$ 3,290.00	No Bid	

BARODA

5,700	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.19	\$ 86,583.00	16.75	\$ 95,475.00	No Bid	
700	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.04	\$ 10,528.00	17.05	\$ 11,935.00	No Bid	
400	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 14.44	\$ 5,776.00	15.50	\$ 6,200.00	No Bid	
100	Septic Slag	\$ 15.49	\$ 1,549.00	16.50	\$ 1,650.00	No Bid	
1,400	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	\$ 46.95	\$ 65,730.00	No Bid		\$ 38.16	\$ 53,424.00
575	Trap Rock FA-2	\$ 46.95	\$ 26,996.25	No Bid		\$ 38.16	\$ 21,942.00