

<b>BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT</b>					1 OF 2	
<b>DENSE GRADED AGGREGATES</b>					Bid 2023-060	
<b>RECORD OF BIDS</b>					Bid due 04/26/2023	
<b>CONTRACTOR</b>	<b>Yellow Rose Transport</b>	<b>Michiana Aggregate, Inc. / Yerington Brothers</b>	<b>Stoneco of Michigan</b>	<b>Northern Construction Services, Corp.</b>	<b>Kalin Construction Co., Inc.</b>	

<b>PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 22A</b>											
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount
2500	Benton Harbor Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.90	\$ 27,250.00	\$ 10.90	\$ 27,250.00	\$ 11.86	\$ 29,650.00	\$ 14.76	\$ 36,900.00
2000	Watervliet Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.54	\$ 21,080.00	\$ 10.90	\$ 21,800.00	\$ 11.86	\$ 23,720.00	\$ 15.47	\$ 30,940.00
2000	Eau Claire Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.23	\$ 20,460.00	\$ 10.75	\$ 21,500.00	\$ 11.77	\$ 23,540.00	\$ 12.56	\$ 25,120.00
2000	Baroda Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.70	\$ 21,400.00	\$ 12.10	\$ 24,200.00	\$ 11.86	\$ 23,720.00	\$ 14.62	\$ 29,240.00
1500	Three Oaks Yard	No Bid		\$ 11.20	\$ 16,800.00	\$ 13.35	\$ 20,025.00	\$ 13.95	\$ 20,925.00	\$ 16.53	\$ 24,795.00
2000	Bakertown Yard	No Bid		\$ 9.85	\$ 19,700.00	\$ 12.10	\$ 24,200.00	\$ 12.04	\$ 24,080.00	\$ 14.05	\$ 28,100.00

<b>ALTERNATE BID MDOT SPEC 22A at STOCKPILE</b>											
Gravel	Area	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location
MDOT 22A	Baroda Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 22A	Eau Claire Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Dowagiac	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 22A	Benton Harbor Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 22A	Watervliet Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Lawrence	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 22A	Three Oaks Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 22A	Niles-Buchanan Area	No Bid		\$ 6.50	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	

<b>PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 23A</b>											
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount
3000	Benton Harbor Yard	No Bid		\$ 11.15	\$ 33,450.00	\$ 10.90	\$ 32,700.00	\$ 12.18	\$ 36,540.00	\$ 14.76	\$ 44,280.00
1500	Watervliet Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.79	\$ 16,185.00	\$ 10.90	\$ 16,350.00	\$ 12.18	\$ 18,270.00	\$ 15.47	\$ 23,205.00
3500	Eau Claire Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.48	\$ 36,680.00	\$ 10.75	\$ 37,625.00	\$ 12.09	\$ 42,315.00	\$ 12.56	\$ 43,960.00
2500	Baroda Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.95	\$ 27,375.00	\$ 12.10	\$ 30,250.00	\$ 12.18	\$ 30,450.00	\$ 14.62	\$ 36,550.00
1000	Three Oaks Yard	No Bid		\$ 11.45	\$ 11,450.00	\$ 13.35	\$ 13,350.00	\$ 14.27	\$ 14,270.00	\$ 16.53	\$ 16,530.00
2000	Bakertown Yard	No Bid		\$ 10.10	\$ 20,200.00	\$ 12.10	\$ 24,200.00	\$ 12.36	\$ 24,720.00	\$ 14.05	\$ 28,100.00

<b>ALTERNATE BID MDOT 23A at STOCKPILE</b>											
Gravel	Area	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location
MDOT 23A	Baroda Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A	Niles-Buchanan Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Dowagiac	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A	Benton Harbor Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A	Watervliet Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Lawrence	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A	Three Oaks Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A	Niles-Buchanan Area	No Bid		\$ 6.75	Niles	\$ 6.00	Dowagiac	No Bid		No Bid	

<b>BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT</b>				2 OF 2			
<b>DENSE GRADED AGGREGATES</b>				Bid 2023-060			
<b>RECORD OF BIDS</b>				Bid due 04/26/2023			
<b>CONTRACTOR</b>	<b>Yellow Rose Transport</b>	<b>Michiana Aggregate, Inc. / Yerington Brothers</b>	<b>Stoneco of Michigan</b>	<b>Northern Construction Services, Corp.</b>	<b>Kalin Construction Co., Inc.</b>		

<b>PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT 22A SLAG</b>											
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount
3000	Eau Claire Yard	\$ 30.30	\$ 90,900.00			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
2000	Bakertown Yard	\$ 31.80	\$ 63,600.00			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

<b>ALTERNATE BID MDOT SPEC 23A at STOCKPILE</b>											
Gravel	Area	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location	Price Per Ton	Stockpile Location		
MDOT 23A SLAG	Bakertown Area	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
MDOT 23A SLAG	Eau Claire Area	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

<b>TOTAL</b>			\$ 154,500.00		\$ 272,030.00		\$ 293,450.00		\$ 312,200.00		\$ 367,720.00
--------------	--	--	---------------	--	---------------	--	---------------	--	---------------	--	---------------