

<b>BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT</b>		<b>1 OF 2</b>
<b>ASPHALT EMULSION</b>		<b>03/16/2022</b>
<b>BASE PROPOSAL - RECORD OF BIDS</b>		<b>Bid #2022-027</b>
<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>BIT MAT PRODUCTS</b>	<b>MICHIGAN PAVING &amp; MATERIALS</b>
<b>BASE PROPOSAL - DELIVERY: MAY 3, 2022 TO OCTOBER 1, 2022</b>		
<i>A. TYPE MS-OP ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 130,000 Gal.)	\$ 4.94	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$ 4.90	No Bid
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>
This Bid is based on posted price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 600.00	No Bid
F.O.B	Whiting, IN	No Bid
The invoiced price decrease will be: -(\$ _____ ) per gallon for each \$5.00 variation in the posted price of asphalt cement.	\$ 0.015	No Bid
<i>B. ALTERNATE BID: TYPE DUST STOP ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 130,000 Gal.)	\$ 1.70	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$ 1.65	No Bid
<i>C. HFS-2M ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 420,000 Gal.)	\$2.295	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$2.245	No Bid
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>
This Bid is based on posted price of asphalt cement of:	\$600.00	No Bid
F.O.B	Whiting, IN	No Bid
The invoiced price decrease will be: -(\$ _____ ) per gallon for each \$5.00 variation in the posted price of asphalt cement.	\$0.015	No Bid
<i>D. ALTERNATE BID: TYPE CRS ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 4200,000 Gal.)	\$ 2.30	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$ 2.25	No Bid
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>
This Bid is based on posted price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 600.00	No Bid
F.O.B	Whiting, IN	No Bid
LOCATION OF PLANT:	24359 SR 23, South Bend, IN 46619	No Bid

<b>BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT</b>		<b>2 OF 2</b>
<b>ASPHALT EMULSION</b>		<b>03/16/2022</b>
<b>BASE PROPOSAL - RECORD OF BIDS</b>		<b>Bid #2022-027</b>
<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>BIT MAT PRODUCTS</b>	<b>MICHIGAN PAVING &amp; MATERIALS</b>
<b>OPTION PROPOSAL - SECOND YEAR - DELIVERY: MAY 3, 2023 TO OCTOBER 1, 2023</b>		
<i>A. TYPE MS-OP ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 100,000 Gal.)	\$ 5.14	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$ 5.10	No Bid
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>
This Bid is based on posted price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 600.00	No Bid
F.O.B	Whiting, IN	No Bid
The invoiced price decrease will be: -(\$ _____ ) per gallon for each \$5.00 variation in the posted price of asphalt cement.	\$ 0.015	No Bid
<i>B. ALTERNATE BID: TYPE DUST STOP ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 100,000 Gal.)	\$ 1.90	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$ 1.85	No Bid
<i>C. HFS-2M ASPHALT EMULSION</i>		
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>	<b>PRICE PER GAL.</b>
Tank Truck Transport. Job Site any place within Berrien County (Approx. 700,000 Gal.)	\$2.495	No Bid
Berrien County Road Department to pick up material at plant	\$2.445	No Bid
	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>	<b>PRICE PER TON</b>
This Bid is based on posted price of asphalt cement of:	\$600.00	No Bid
F.O.B	Whiting, IN	No Bid
The invoiced price decrease will be: -(\$ _____ ) per gallon for each \$5.00 variation in the posted price of asphalt cement.	\$0.015	No Bid
<b>LOCATION OF PLANT:</b>	24359 SR 23, South Bend, IN 46619	No Bid