

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT								1 OF 2	
AGGREGATES								BID # 2022-022	
RECORD OF BIDS								Bid Due 2/23/2022	
CONTRACTOR		KENNETH SMITH, INC.		YELLOW ROSE TRANSPORT		VERPLANK TRUCKING CO.		KLINK TRUCKING	
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
WATERVLIET									
1000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 18.45	\$ 18,450.00	\$ 23.80	\$ 23,800.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
200	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 18.45	\$ 3,690.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 5,950.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
BENTON HARBOR									
800	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 17.95	\$ 14,360.00	\$ 23.80	\$ 19,040.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
200	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 18.15	\$ 3,630.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 5,950.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
500	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51.23	\$25,615.00	NO BID	NO BID
200	Septic Slag	\$ 17.95	\$ 3,590.00	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
500	*CST TRAP ROCK			\$ 52.35	\$ 26,175.00				
EAU CLAIRE									
2300	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 17.95	\$ 41,285.00	\$ 23.80	\$ 54,740.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
200	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 18.15	\$ 3,630.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 5,950.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
350	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.79	\$18,476.50	NO BID	NO BID
250	Ind. No. 11 Limestone	\$ 27.75	\$ 6,937.50	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
350	*CST TRAP ROCK			\$ 55.85	\$ 19,547.50				
THREE OAKS									
1800	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 16.70	\$ 30,060.00	\$ 23.80	\$ 42,840.00	-	-	\$27.25	\$ 49,050.00
1100	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 16.90	\$ 18,590.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 32,725.00	-	-	\$27.50	\$ 30,250.00
BAKERTOWN									
700	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 17.75	\$ 12,425.00	\$ 23.80	\$ 16,660.00	-	-	\$29.50	\$ 20,650.00
800	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 17.95	\$ 14,360.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 23,800.00	-	-	\$29.75	\$ 23,800.00
550	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 53.73	\$29,551.50	NO BID	NO BID
400	Ind. No. 12 Limestone	\$ 27.25	\$ 10,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
150	Septic Slag	\$ 17.50	\$ 2,625.00	NO BID	NO BID	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
600	Ind. No. 5 BF Slag	\$ 17.50	\$ 10,500.00	-	-	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
550	*CST TRAP ROCK			\$ 55.85	\$ 30,717.50				
BARODA									
4850	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 17.75	\$ 86,087.50	\$ 23.80	\$ 115,430.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
1500	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 17.75	\$ 26,625.00	\$ 29.75	\$ 44,625.00	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
650	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.79	\$34,313.50	NO BID	NO BID
650	Trap Rock FA-2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 52.79	\$34,313.50	NO BID	NO BID
250	Ind. No. 11 Limestone	\$ 27.75	\$ 6,937.50	NO BID	NO BID	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
250	MDOT No. 17A Limestone	\$ 23.50	\$ 5,875.00	NO BID	NO BID	-	-	NO BID	NO BID
650	*CST TRAP ROCK			\$ 55.85	\$ 36,302.50				
650	*34CS TRAP ROCK			\$ 48.00	\$ 31,200.00				
* = ADDED TO BID BY SUBMITTING VENDOR AS SUBSTITUTE CONSIDERATION						AWARDED CONTRACT			

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT				2 OF 2
AGGREGATES				BID # 2022-022
RECORD OF BIDS				Bid Due 2/23/2022
CONTRACTOR	KENNETH SMITH, INC.	YELLOW ROSE TRANSPORT	VERPLANK TRUCKING CO.	KLINK TRUCKING
TERMS	NET 30 DAYS	NET 30 DAYS	NET 30 DAYS	NET 30 DAYS
REMARKS		Shipping starting March 1st to guarantee June 1st deadline	Call dispatch for scheduling	
TOTAL AWARDED IN GREEN	\$ 208,727.50	\$ 155,890.00	\$ 142,270.00	\$ -

AWARDED CONTRACT