

DENSE GRADED AGGREGATES

Bid 2022-025

RECORD OF BIDS

Bid Due 02/23/2022

| | | | | | |
|-------------------|---------------------------------|----------------------------|----------------------------------------------|----------------------------|-------------------------------------|
| CONTRACTOR | MICHIANA AGGREGATE, INC. | BRUSKY CONSTRUCTION | NORTHERN CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, CORP. | STONECO OF MICHIGAN | KALIN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. |
|-------------------|---------------------------------|----------------------------|----------------------------------------------|----------------------------|-------------------------------------|

PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 22A

| ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON) | | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount |
|----------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|
| 2500 | Benton Harbor Yard | \$ 10.24 | \$ 25,600.00 | \$ 9.99 | \$ 24,975.00 | \$ 9.39 | \$ 23,475.00 | \$ 10.50 | \$ 26,250.00 | \$ 11.67 | \$ 29,175.00 |
| 2000 | Watervliet Yard | \$ 9.99 | \$ 19,980.00 | \$ 10.99 | \$ 21,980.00 | \$ 9.39 | \$ 18,780.00 | \$ 9.50 | \$ 19,000.00 | \$ 12.46 | \$ 24,920.00 |
| 2000 | Eau Claire Yard | \$ 9.44 | \$ 18,880.00 | \$ 9.99 | \$ 19,980.00 | \$ 8.79 | \$ 17,580.00 | \$ 11.00 | \$ 22,000.00 | \$ 10.72 | \$ 21,440.00 |
| 2000 | Baroda Yard | \$ 9.89 | \$ 19,780.00 | \$ 9.59 | \$ 19,180.00 | \$ 9.39 | \$ 18,780.00 | \$ 12.50 | \$ 25,000.00 | \$ 11.67 | \$ 23,340.00 |
| 1500 | Three Oaks Yard | \$ 10.69 | \$ 16,035.00 | \$ 10.99 | \$ 16,485.00 | \$ 11.60 | \$ 17,400.00 | \$ 13.50 | \$ 20,250.00 | \$ 13.21 | \$ 19,815.00 |
| 2000 | Bakertown Yard | \$ 9.29 | \$ 18,580.00 | \$ 8.89 | \$ 17,780.00 | \$ 10.99 | \$ 21,980.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 26,000.00 | \$ 11.67 | \$ 23,340.00 |

ALTERNATE BID 22A

| Gravel | Area | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location |
|----------|---------------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|----------------------|---------------|--------------------|
| MDOT 22A | Baroda Area | \$ 6.25 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 22A | Eau Claire Area | \$ 6.25 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 22A | Benton Harbor Area | \$ 6.25 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 22A | Watervliet Area | \$ 6.25 | Winkle, Lawrence | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 22A | Three Oaks Area | \$ 6.25 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 22A | Niles-Buchanan Area | \$ 6.25 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 6.75 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | Bakeman Rd, Dowagiac | No Bid | No Bid |

PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 23A

| ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON) | | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount | Price Per Ton | Amount |
|----------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|---------------|--------------|
| 3000 | Benton Harbor Yard | \$ 10.24 | \$ 30,720.00 | \$ 10.49 | \$ 31,470.00 | \$ 10.73 | \$ 32,190.00 | \$ 10.50 | \$ 31,500.00 | \$ 12.09 | \$ 36,270.00 |
| 1500 | Watervliet Yard | \$ 9.99 | \$ 14,985.00 | \$ 11.49 | \$ 17,235.00 | \$ 10.14 | \$ 15,210.00 | \$ 9.50 | \$ 14,250.00 | \$ 12.88 | \$ 19,320.00 |
| 3500 | Eau Claire Yard | \$ 9.74 | \$ 34,090.00 | \$ 9.99 | \$ 34,965.00 | \$ 9.20 | \$ 32,200.00 | \$ 11.00 | \$ 38,500.00 | \$ 11.14 | \$ 38,990.00 |
| 2500 | Baroda Yard | \$ 10.24 | \$ 25,600.00 | \$ 10.09 | \$ 25,225.00 | \$ 11.38 | \$ 28,450.00 | \$ 12.50 | \$ 31,250.00 | \$ 12.09 | \$ 30,225.00 |
| 1000 | Three Oaks Yard | \$ 11.02 | \$ 11,020.00 | \$ 11.49 | \$ 11,490.00 | \$ 12.74 | \$ 12,740.00 | \$ 13.50 | \$ 13,500.00 | \$ 13.63 | \$ 13,630.00 |
| 2000 | Bakertown Yard | \$ 9.80 | \$ 19,600.00 | \$ 9.39 | \$ 18,780.00 | \$ 12.24 | \$ 24,480.00 | \$ 13.00 | \$ 26,000.00 | \$ 12.09 | \$ 24,180.00 |

ALTERNATE BID 23A

| Gravel | Area | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location | Price Per Ton | Stockpile Location |
|----------|---------------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|-----------------------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------------|
| MDOT 23A | Baroda Area | \$ 6.50 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 23A | Eau Claire Area | \$ 6.50 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 23A | Benton Harbor Area | \$ 6.50 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 23A | Watervliet Area | \$ 6.50 | Winkle, Lawrence | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 23A | Three Oaks Area | \$ 6.50 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |
| MDOT 23A | Niles-Buchanan Area | \$ 6.50 | Hendershot | - | - | \$ 7.25 | Hover Pit: Indian Lake Road | \$ 5.50 | 56th Ave, Lawrence | No Bid | No Bid |

| | | | | | |
|-------------------------------|----------------------|---------------|----------------------|--------|---------------|
| Terms: | 30 Days | Not Described | Net 30 Days | Net 30 | Not Described |
| TOTAL AWARDED IN GREEN | \$ 136,015.00 | | \$ 117,995.00 | | |

AWARDED CONTRACT