

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT				1 OF 1	
AGGREGATES				P	Bid #2021-004
RECORD OF BIDS				01/15/21	
CONSTRUCTOR		KENNETH SMITH INC		THE KLINK GROUP	
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
WATERVLIET					
1400	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.64	\$ 21,896.00	\$ 25.25	\$ 35,350.00
550	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.64	\$ 8,602.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 14,025.00
BENTON HARBOR					
1500	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.14	\$ 22,710.00	\$ 25.25	\$ 37,875.00
350	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.39	\$ 5,386.50	\$ 25.50	\$ 8,925.00
450	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
EAU CLAIRE					
2800	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.14	\$ 42,392.00	\$ 25.25	\$ 70,700.00
600	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.34	\$ 9,204.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 15,300.00
350	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
THREE OAKS					
1550	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 13.70	\$ 21,235.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 34,100.00
450	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 13.89	\$ 6,250.50	\$ 22.25	\$ 10,012.50
BAKERTOWN					
2450	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.78	\$ 36,211.00	\$ 23.25	\$ 56,962.50
450	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.78	\$ 6,651.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 10,575.00
550	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BARODA					
3300	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.89	\$ 49,137.00	\$ 23.25	\$ 76,725.00
1150	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.89	\$ 17,123.50	\$ 23.50	\$ 27,025.00
650	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Awarded to Kenneth Smith Inc