

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT		1 OF 1	
DENSE GRADED AGGREGATES		P	Bid #2020-027
RECORD OF BIDS			03/27/20

<b>CONTRACTOR</b>	<b>MICHIANA AGGREGATE</b>	<b>HOLLERBACH EXCAVATING</b>	<b>KALIN CONSTRUCTION</b>
-------------------	---------------------------	------------------------------	---------------------------

<b>PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 22A</b>
-------------------------------------

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount
3000	Benton Harbor Yard	\$ 8.43	\$ 25,290.00	\$ 8.96	\$ 26,880.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 28,680.00
1500	Watervliet Yard	\$ 9.32	\$ 13,980.00	\$ 9.43	\$ 14,145.00	\$ 10.22	\$ 15,330.00
1500	Eau Claire Yard	\$ 7.98	\$ 11,970.00	\$ 8.67	\$ 13,005.00	\$ 8.10	\$ 12,150.00
3000	Baroda Yard	\$ 8.11	\$ 24,330.00	\$ 8.47	\$ 25,410.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 28,680.00
1500	Three Oaks Yard	\$ 8.82	\$ 13,230.00	\$ 9.16	\$ 13,740.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 16,500.00
2500	Bakertown Yard	\$ 7.67	\$ 19,175.00	\$ 8.28	\$ 20,700.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 23,900.00

<b>ALTERNATE BID 22A</b>
--------------------------

Gravel	Area	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile
MDOT 22A	Baroda Area	\$ 6.50	Brown Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 22A	Eau Claire Area	\$ 5.75	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 22A	Benton Harbor Area	\$ 5.75	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 22A	Watervliet Area	\$ 5.75	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 22A	Three Oaks Area	\$ 5.75	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 22A	Niles-Buchanan Area	\$ 5.75	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID

<b>PRICE SCHEDULE MDOT SPEC 23A</b>
-------------------------------------

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount	Price Per Ton	Amount
1500	Benton Harbor Yard	\$ 8.87	\$ 13,305.00	\$ 9.48	\$ 14,220.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 14,340.00
750	Watervliet Yard	\$ 9.82	\$ 7,365.00	\$ 9.43	\$ 7,072.50	\$ 10.22	\$ 7,665.00
1000	Eau Claire Yard	\$ 8.74	\$ 8,740.00	\$ 8.67	\$ 8,670.00	\$ 8.10	\$ 8,100.00
1500	Baroda Yard	\$ 8.23	\$ 12,345.00	\$ 8.99	\$ 13,485.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 14,340.00
750	Three Oaks Yard	\$ 9.32	\$ 6,990.00	\$ 9.68	\$ 7,260.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 8,250.00
1500	Bakertown Yard	\$ 8.17	\$ 12,255.00	\$ 8.80	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 9.56	\$ 14,340.00

<b>ALTERNATE BID 23A</b>
--------------------------

Gravel	Area	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile	Price Per Ton	Location of Stockpile
MDOT 23A	Baroda Area	\$ 6.00	Brown Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 23A	Eau Claire Area	\$ 6.00	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 23A	Benton Harbor Area	\$ 6.00	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 23A	Watervliet Area	\$ 6.00	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 23A	Three Oaks Area	\$ 6.00	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
MDOT 23A	Niles-Buchanan Area	\$ 6.00	Hendershot Pit	N/A	N/A	NO BID	NO BID

\$ 168,975.00

\$ 177,787.50

\$ 192,275.00