

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT				1 OF 1	
AGGREGATES				P	Bid #2020-01
RECORD OF BIDS				01/09/20	
CONSTRUCTOR		KENNETH SMITH		VERPLANK TRUCKING CO	
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES (TON)		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
WATERVLIET					
50	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.74	\$ 787.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.74	\$ 787.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 15.74	\$ 787.00	No Bid	No Bid
700	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.68	\$ 29,876.00
BENTON HARBOR					
3800	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.24	\$ 57,912.00	No Bid	No Bid
900	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.49	\$ 13,941.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 15.49	\$ 774.50	No Bid	No Bid
200	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 43.30	\$ 8,660.00
EAU CLAIRE					
1600	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 15.24	\$ 24,384.00	No Bid	No Bid
100	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 15.44	\$ 1,544.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 15.24	\$ 762.00	No Bid	No Bid
150	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.86	\$ 6,729.00
THREE OAKS					
2000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 13.80	\$ 27,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
800	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 13.99	\$ 11,192.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 14.45	\$ 722.50	No Bid	No Bid
TBD	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.80	TBD
BAKERTOWN					
1000	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.88	\$ 14,880.00	No Bid	No Bid
300	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.88	\$ 4,464.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 14.88	\$ 744.00	No Bid	No Bid
700	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.80	\$ 32,060.00
BARODA					
3800	Ind. No. 11 BF Slag	\$ 14.99	\$ 56,962.00	No Bid	No Bid
1100	Ind. No. 9 BF Slag	\$ 14.99	\$ 16,489.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Septic Slag	\$ 14.99	\$ 749.50	No Bid	No Bid
500	Trap Rock FA-3 1/2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.86	\$ 22,430.00